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Picture Function Function Description Required Parts 
 
 
 
 
 

Passage Latch bolt operated by lever from either side at all times. 
3800U-55L  

Leverset 

 
 
 
 
 

Bathroom Indicator 
Latch bolt operated by lever from either side at all times.  Dead bolt operated 
by thumbturn from inside and by emergency release with indicator from 
outside. 

3800U-55B 
Leverset  

2-669-0736 

 
 
 
 
 

 Privacy 
Latch bolt operated by lever from either side at all times.  Dead bolt operated 
by thumbturn from inside and by emergency release from outside. 

3800U-55S 
Leverset  
3000R 

 
 
 
 
 

Classroom 
Latch bolt operated by lever from either side.  Dead bolt operated by key from 
outside.  Operating inside lever retracts both latchbolt and deadbolt 
simultaneously. 

3800U-55P 
Leverset 

Split Spindle* 
3000H 
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Storeroom 
Latch bolt operated by key from outside or by operating inside lever.  Outside 
lever never retracts latch.  

3800U-55M 
Leverset 

Half Spindle** 
3000H 

 
 
 
 
 

Security Storeroom 
Latch bolt operated by key from outside or by operating inside lever.  Outside 
lever never retracts latch. Auxiliary dead latch. 

3800U-55T 
Leverset 

Half Spindle** 
3000H 

 
 
 
 
 

Exit 
Latch bolt operated by lever from either side. Dead bolt operated by key from 
outside and by thumbturn from inside.  Operating inside lever retracts both 
latchbolt and deadbolt simultaneously. 

3800U-55P 
Leverset 

Split Spindle* 
3000C 

 
 
 
 
 

Entrance 
Latch bolt operated by lever from either side. Dead bolt operated by key from 
either side. 

3800U-55S 
Leverset 
3000D 

 
 
 
 
 

Bedroom 
Latch bolt operated by lever from either side. Dead bolt operated by 
thumbturn from inside and emergency release from outside. Operating inside 
lever retracts both latchbolt and deadbolt simultaneously. 

3800U-55P 
Leverset 

Split Spindle* 
3000R 

 
 
 
 
 

Dormitory 
Latch bolt operated by lever from either side. Dead bolt operated by key from 
outside and thumbturn from inside. 

3800U-55S 
Leverset 
3000C 

 
 
 
 
 

Institutional Latch bolt operated by key from either side.  Neither lever retracts latch.  
3800U-55M 
Leverset*** 

3000D 

 
 
 
 
 

Security Institutional 
Latch bolt operated by key from either side.  Neither lever retracts latch. 
Auxiliary dead latch. 

3800U-55T 
Leverset*** 

3000D 
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Security Classroom 
Latch bolt operated by lever from either side. Dead bolt operated by key from 
inside or outside. Operating inside lever retracts both latchbolt and deadbolt 
simultaneously. 

3800U-55P 
Leverset 

Split Spindle* 
3000D 

 
 
 
 
 

Double Dead Bolt Dead bolt operated by key from either side. No latch. 
3800U-55F 

3000D 

 
 
 
 
 

Privacy Dead Bolt 
Dead bolt operated by key from outside and by thumbturn from inside. No 
latch. 

3800U-55F 
3000C 

 
 
 
 
 

Single Deadbolt Dead bolt operated by key from outside only. No Latch 
3800U-55F 

3000H 

 

* Use the split spindle in place of the spindle that comes with the leverset. 

** Use the half spindle going into the inside lever in place of the spindle that comes with the leverset. 

*** Do not install the spindle that comes with the leverset. 

 


